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Motivating pro-group behaviour: 
Degree of identification and type of anonymity as determinants of the 
choice to work on behalf of a low status group 

The very existence of a group may depend on its ability to motivate its members to 
stick together and strive for the achievement of the group's goals. In low status 
groups, this ability is especially relevant: if group members cannot be stimulated to 
work on the improvement of the group's status, the group's standing remains rela­
tively poor and as a consequence part of its members may prefer to direct themselves 
towards social mobility to a more highly evaluated group (Eilemers, 1993; Tajfel & 
Turner, 1979). The more group members do so, the less likely the group is to 
improve its lower standing, and the more disadvantaged will be those who, due to 
objective or subjective obstacles, do not have the opportunity to leave the group. In 
this paper, we exarnine social identity and contextual determinants of group mem­
bers' choices to stand by their low status ingroup and strive for an improvement of 
the group's position. Specifically, we start by discussing the role of degree of identi­
fkation with a group in determining pro-group behaviour. Subsequently, we examine 
how contextual factors associated with anonymity manipulations are likely to affect 
low and high identifiers ' willingness to work on behalf of their low status ingroup. 

The effect of degree of identification 

Previous research on people's reactions to membership in low status groups has 
revealed that degree of identification with the group is a crucial determinant of dis­
plays of pro-group behaviour (Doosje, Eilemers, & Spears, 1999; Jetten, Spears, & 
Manstead, 1997; Keily, 1993; Ouwerkerk, Eilemers, & De Oilder, 1999; Spears, 
Doosje, & Eilemers, 1997, 1999; Wann & Branscombe, 1990). Indeed, social iden­
tity theory and self-categorisation theory postulate that identification with a given 
social group is accompanied by the internalisation of group norms and interests, and 
their adoption as personally relevant values and goals (Tajfel & Turner, 1979; 
Turner, Hogg, Oakes, Reicher, & Wethereil, 1987). lt seems to foilow that the 
stronger a group member's identification with a group and its goals, the greater his or 
her willingness to strive for the improvement of the group' s status should beo Con­
sistent with this view, previous research has shown that differences in the degree to 
which group members identify with a low status ingroup are consistently associated 
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with the extent to which group members exert themselves for the achievement of the 
group's goals (Barreto & Ellemers, in press; Ellemers, Spears, & Doosje, 1997; 
James & Cropanzano, 1994). With regard to preferred strategy for status improve­
ment, whereas high identifiers tend to choose to work on behalf of the group, low 
identifiers generally prefer to strive for individual mobility into a higher status group. 

Given this state of affairs, the crucial question seems to be how low identifiers can 
be motivated to value the group's interests and strive for the improvement of its 
standing. This question seems even more pertinent given that of ten those group mem­
bers who identify the least with a low status ingroup are highly competent group 
members who could possibly make a valuable contribution to the group's improve­
ment (Ellemers, Van Knippenberg, De Vries, & Wilke, 1988). In thls paper we will 
examine how anonymity manipulations may play a role in this process. In fact, pre­
vious research has shown that anonymity manipulations may help elucidate the 
processes through which group members may be motivated to adopt the norms of the 
group (e.g., Barreto & Ellemers, in press; Postrnes & Spears, thls volume). We will 
therefore start by considering how anonymity has been conceived and manipulated, 
and with which effects it has been associated. Subsequently, we will focus on 
anonymity to the ingroup and dedicate greater attention to the effects that different 
types of anonymity may have on low and high identifiers ' willingness to work on the 
improvement of a low status ingroup. 

The effects of anonymity 

Contrary to what was traditionally assumed (e.g., Le Bon, 1895/1995; Tarde, 
1890/1921), research on the social identity model of deindividuation effects (SIDE 

model) has shown that anonymity may be associated with an increase rather than a 
decrease in the adoption of group norms (Reicher, Spears, & Postrnes, 1995; Spears 
& Lea, 1994). For instance, Spears, Lea, & Lee (1990) found that, during computer 
mediated discussions, group members followed group norms more closely when 
seated in separate cubicles, than when facing each other in the same room (see also 
Lea, Spears, & De Groot, 1999; Postrnes, 1997; Postrnes & Spears, 1998; Reicher, 
1984). From a self-categorisation perspective (Turner et al., 1987), these authors 
argued that group members internalise the norms of the groups with which they iden­
tify and therefore do not need to be in the presence of the group in order to display 
normative behaviour. On the contrary, the presence of other group members could in 
fact function so as to decrease salience of group membership, since it allows group 
members to focus on individual differences within the group (the cognitive compo­
nent of the SIDE model; see also Postrnes, Spears, & Lea, 1999; Reicher et al. 1995). 
This reduced salience of group membership in the presence of others would in turn 
result in a decrease of normative expressions. By contrast, anonymous circumstances 
were seen to favour the perception of the group as an homogeneous unity, promoting 
depersonalised self-perception, and eliciting group normative expressions. 

However, results of empirical investigations into the effects of anonymity have not 
been entirely consistent, and effects opposite to what was predicted have also been 
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found (see also Postmes & Spears, 1998; Postmes, et al. 1999; Postmes, Spears & 
Lea, in press). Abrams, WetherelI, Cochrane, Hogg, & Turner (1990), for instance, 
showed that, when judging the size of stimulus lines in a replication of Asch' s (1956) 
paradigm, participants were more influenced by the ingroup when they were asked to 
state their responses aloud than when their answers were to remain anonymous (see 
also Barreto & Ellemers, in press; Batson, Ahmad, Yin, Bedell, Johnson, Templin, & 
Whiteside, 1999; Noel, Wann, & Branscombe, 1995). Although these authors also 
attributed the effect of anonymity to variations in salience of group membership, the 
precise effect proposed by Abrams et al. (1990), opposite to that posited by the SIDE 

model, was that co-presence of group members was said to increase salience of group 
membership. 

While at fIrst sight these results seem to be inconsistent with each other, a closer 
look at the research in question reveals that this is not necessarily the case (see also 
Postmes & Spears, 1998). In what follows we will examine some aspects that are 
likely to determine how anonymity manipulations are likely to affect group mem­
bers' responses. SpecifIcally, we will argue that the effect of anonymity on group 
members ' behaviour will depend on the particular ways in which it is conceived. It is 
our belief that the systematic examination of different aspects of the methodology 
that has been used is likely to contribute to the reconciliation of previous research. 
More importantly, the close examination of these various aspects is likely to provide 
further insight into the diverse processes through which group members may be 
motivated to follow group norms. 

Types of anonymity 

When examining the effects of anonymity it is important to recognise that anonymity 
is not an absolute concept, but instead gains meaning by reference to a context in 
which people are less anonymous. That is, what we talk about when we talk about 
anonymity is defmed by reference to the specifIc situations that are being contrasted 
with each other. As a consequence, it is possible to fmd considerable variation in what 
have been regarded as anonymous circumstances. For instance, in a few studies, 
anonymity was compared with a situation in which participants were held accountable 
to the ingroup for their responses (Barreto & Ellemers, in press; Batson et al., 1999; 
Ellemers, Van Dyck, Hinkle, & Jacobs, 1999; Noel et al., 1995). Here, anonymity 
corresponds to the lack of accountability pressures. By contrast, Abrams et al. (1990, 
study 2) varied whether or not co-present participants were required to state their 
responses aloud, regarding anonymity as the privacy of responses. Another conceptu­
alisation was used by Spears and colleagues (1990) who kept responses public in all 
conditions and, instead, varied whether or not participants could see each other. 

Although some aspects of anonymity manipulations may often co-vary in natural sit­
uations, they can be seen as theoretically independent, and associated with quite differ­
ent effects. SpecifIcally, people may anticipate being held accountable without having 
to actually state their responses aloud, or knowing what other participants say. In such 
cases, accountability is likely to primarily introduce concerns with self-presentation to 
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others, which is likely to result in responses in line with the audience's norms. Like­
wise, manipulations of visibility to the ingroup do not necessarily imply accountability 
pressures. Specifically, visibility of respondents to each other is likely to be associated 
with greater focus on interpersonal differences, undermining salience of group mem­
bership. In addition to this more cognitive effect, visibility of group members ' 
responses is likely to be associated with a greater c1arity of the group norm, as well as 
with the opportunity to communicate with and persuade others. The specific effect of 
these independent manipulations is likely to be determined by how the remaining 
aspects are controlled for. So, for instance, if all respondents are visible to the ingroup, 
the manipulation of visibility of responses is likely to be accompanied by self-presen­
tational concerns, which may result in an increase in pro-group responses. However, 
this is less likely to happen if respondents are not in view of each other. 

Another aspect that will determine the effects of anonymity manipulations is the 
nature of the particular audience to which participants are not anonymous. In fact, 
among other variations in procedures employed to manipulate anonymity, previous 
studies differ from each other with respect to whom participants were made anony­
mous. While in some studies participants were rendered anonymous to the ingroup 
(e.g., Barreto & Ellemers, in press; Batson et al., 1999; Noel et al., 1995; Postmes, 
Spears, Sakhel, & De Groot, 1998), in others they were made anonymous to the out­
group (e.g., Reicher & Levine, 1994), to both ingroup and outgroup (e.g., Postmes, 
1997, study 4; Spears et al., 1990), or even to the experimenter (Reicher, Levine, & 
Gordijn, 1998). Clearly, the effect of an audience is likely to be shaped by the char­
acteristics of the specific audience in question. For instance, whereas accountability 
to the ingroup is likely to result in endorsement of ingroup norms (Barreto & Elle­
mers, in press), accountability to the outgroup may re sult in the opposite effect, that 
is, in a moderation of the expression of ingroup norms (Reicher & Levine, 1994). 

In short, anonymity effects on the adoption of group norms seem to vary widely. 
These variations can be associated with the diversity of ways in which anonymity has 
been conceived and manipulated. It seems reasonable to anticipate that these varia­
tions in procedure may be associated with different psychological processes that will 
in turn result in distinct responses. Therefore, in order to understand anonymity 
effects, it seems necessary to gain a better understanding of the psychological 
processes underlying different manipulations. The c10ser examination of these 
processes will in turn offer further insight into the different ways through which group 
members may be persuaded to follow group norms. In what follows, we endeavour to 
examine such processes by discussing empirical evidence regarding the effects of 
anonymity to the ingroup. In doing this, our main goal is to examine how specific 
manipulations of anonymity may serve to motivate group members to work on behalf 
of group improvement, especially when lacking an initial motivation to do so. 

Anonymity to the ingroup 

The study of the effects of anonymity to the ingroup is likely to be particularly infor­
mative in the analysis of processes of social influence (see also Barreto & Ellemers, 
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in press; Postrnes & Spears, this volume). In partieular, the examination of the 
effects of accountability to the ingroup is likely to inform us to what extent group 
norms are internalised, or merely followed under surveillance by other ingroup mem­
bers (see also Plant & Devine, 1998). In addition, the investigation of visibility to 
other ingroup members is likely to establish what conditions undermine or instead 
facilitate the cognitive representation of the group as a salient basis for the self-regu­
lation of behaviour. In the following sections we will discuss how manipulations of 
accountability and of visibility to the ingroup may influence group members to fol­
low the norms of the group. In this discussion, we will dedicate close attention to the 
role of degree of identification in moderating the effects of anonymity manipulations. 

Aeeountability to the ingroup and strategie motivations 

Studies focusing on the effects of ingroup accountability generally manipulate the 
expectation that participants ' responses will have to be shared with and justified to 
the remaining ingroup members, rather than being kept private (Barreto & Ellemers, 
in press; Batson et al., 1999; Noel et al. 1995; see also Tetlock, 1996). Although 
research within the SIDE model has mainly focused on accountability to the outgroup, 
the effects of accountability to the ingroup may be included under what this model 
designates as strategie behaviour. Strategie behaviour corresponds to the monitoring 
of the expression of one's internal preferences due to concerns with self-presentation, 
and generally results in responses in line with the audience's norms (see also 
Baumeister, 1982; Leary & Kowalski, 1990; Martin, 1988; Plant & Devine, 1998; 
Raven & Kruglanski, 1970; William, Harkins, & Latane, 1981; inter aUa). 

The processes underlying the display of strategie forms of behaviour will differ 
depending on the audience at hand. Strategie responses to an ingroup audience, in 
partieular, are seen to stem from a fundamental desire to ensure positive evaluation 
by others (Barreto & Ellemers, in press; Noel et al. 1995; see also, Baumeister, 
1982; Leary & Kowalski, 1990; Goffman, 1959; Schlenker, 1980). Accountability to 
the ingroup should then promote pro-group behaviour through an interpersonal 
process of normative influence (Deustch & Gerard, 1955; see also Kelley, 1952). 

Recent investigation of social influence processes has tended to neglect the role 
interpersonal processes may play in motivating group members to attend to the 
norms of the group. Self-categorisation theory, in partieular, has argued that inter­
personal processes lie at the wrong level in the analysis of pro-group behaviour. 
Turner and bis colleagues (1987, e.g.) have defended that pro-group expressions stem 
from the salience of valued identities, whose cognitive representation does not 
require the presence of other ingroup members. Although this seems to constitute an 
important advancement in the understanding of group phenomena, it seems to only 
address the psychology of those group members that identify strongly with the group. 
Indeed, we have previously argued that this conceptualisation of social influence as 
an identity process only may have to date limited our ability to actually comprehend 
the various manners through wbich a group may be able to influence its members 
(Barreto & Ellemers, in press; Ellemers, Barreto, & Spears, 1999; see also Postrnes 
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& Spears, 1999). In particular, we have argued that pro-group behaviour may stem 
both from the internalisation of grOUp nonns that accompanies identification with a 
group, and from mere public compliance, when group nonns are not internalised. 
Specifically, when group nonns are internalised, as when identification with the 
group is high, accountability should not add much to group members' already high 
readiness to follow the group nonn. However, while low identifiers may not be gen­
erally inclined to regard group nonns and goals as self-relevant, they may be moti­
vated to do so when vulnerable to disapproval by others, that is, when accountable to 
the ingroup for their responses. Thus, degree of identification with a group should 
moderate whether accountability to the ingroup will function so as to motivate group 
members to follow the nonns of the group. 

We have tested these predictions by comparing low and high identifiers ' choice of 
status enhancement strategy, under conditions of anonyrnity and conditions of 
accountability to the ingroup (Barreto & Ellemers, in press, study 1). The results 
showed that accountability to the ingroup increased choices to work on group status 
improvement among low identifiers, but that it did not affect high identifiers, who 
always chose to work with the group. That is, consistent with previous research, high 
identifiers showed a consistent tendency to benefit the group (Doosje, Ellemers, & 
Spears, 1999; Turner et al., 1987). By contrast, low identifiers resisted in doing so 
under anonymous conditions, but were motivated to focus on group improvement 
when additional self-presentation considerations were introduced by accountability 
manipulations (see also EIlemers, Barreto, & Spears, 1999). 

In a second study (Barreto & EIlemers, in press, study 2), we manipulated whether 
the group seemed to prefer its members to focus on individual of group improvement 
as a status enhancement strategy (group nonn). The results revealed that high identi­
fiers acted according to the group nonn irrespective of accountability, working on 
individual improvement when that was nonnative, and on group improvement when 
that was preferred. By contrast, again, low identifiers only followed the group nonn 
when accountable to the group. In order to gain further insight into the processes at 
hand, participants were asked to what extent they had been concerned with the group 
during attempts at status improvement. Responses to this question remained anony­
mous in all conditions. High identifiers stated having been concerned with group 
improvement in all conditions, irrespective of the specific manner in which they had 
worked. By contrast, low identifiers reported having had no interest in improving the 
group, despite the fact that they had actually chosen to work with the group when 
that was the nonn and they were accountable for their responses. This supports our 
contention that although low and high identifiers displayed sirnilar behaviour when 
accountable to the ingroup, they did so on the basis of different motivations: whereas 
high identifiers acted out of an intrinsic concern with the fate of the group, low iden­
tifiers seem to have merely responded to interpersonal pressures to comply with the 
audience' s nonn. In addition, these results show that a similar motivation to favour 
the group, as that of high identifiers in the different conditions, may result in differ­
ent fonns of behaviour, that are dictated by what the group considers nonnative. 

In sum, the results of these studies provide evidence for our claim that the group 
may be able to influence its members both through identity processes that imply the 
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internalisation of group nonns, and through interpersonal processes of presentation of 
the individual self. Degree of identification with the ingroup detennines whether one 
or the other type of infIuence will occur, and thus also under what conditions this 
influence will be manifested. 

Visibility to the ingroup 

As we have indicated above, another way in which effects of anonymity have been 
examined is by comparing anonymity with visibility to the ingroup. Visibility to the 
ingroup may refer either to the disclosure of personal infonnation (pictures or sum­
marised biographies), or to the visibility of participants' responses to each other. 
Diverging results in previous research can be traced to differences in the type of 
infonnation that is disclosed to the ingroup. Specifically, studies that have manipu­
lated whether or not infonnation about other group members ' attitudes is made 
known to the ingroup have revealed different results from those found in studies in 
which the disclosure of infonnation regarding other group members' appearance has 
been manipulated. For instance, Abrams et al. (1990) varied whether or not partici­
pants ' responses were public to the ingroup, while they kept participants visible to 
each other in all conditions. Here, the results revealed an increase in confonnity to 
the group nonn under conditions of visibility of responses to the ingroup. By con­
trast, Lea, Spears, & De Groot (1999) manipulated whether respondents could or not 
see each other while exchanging opinions, while responses on the dependent mea­
sures were private in all conditions. These authors found that responses were more 
nonnative when group members were not visibLe to each other (see also Postmes, 
1997). 

This analysis seems to suggest that pro-group responses may ensue either from 
anonymity of respondents and their responses (by promoting depersonalisation of 
self-interest), or from the disclosure of infonnation regarding both other ingroup 
members ' appearance and their opinions (by eliciting concerns with self-presenta­
tion). Thus, it may be that the presence of some personal infonnation only serves to 
undennine the psychological significance of the group, promoting individualistic 
fonns of behaviour, whereas the combination of the two types of infonnation may 
actually render within group interaction more meaningful and motivating. We have 
examined this possibility by separately manipulating visibility of responses and vis­
ibility of respondents, and examining their effects on group members ' willingness to 
work on group improvement (Barreto & Ellemers, 1999b). Consistent with the 
analysis made here, we expected pro-group responses to be greater both under con­
ditions of tota! anonymity to the ingroup, and when both respondents and their 
responses were visible to the ingroup. However, we also expected degree of identi­
fication to function as a moderator of this effect of anonymity manipulations. As in 
previous research, we expected high identifiers to be consistently concerned with the 
improvement of the ingroup, irrespective of anonyrnity manipulations. Anonymity 
was predicted to have an effect only on Low identifiers ' choices to work on behalf of 
group improvement. That is, low identifiers were expected to work on behalf of the 
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group both when totally anonymous to the ingroup (when depersonalised), and when 
totally visible to the ingroup (when concerned with self-presentation to other 
ingroup members). 

Moreover, we expected that pro-group expressions in conditions of total 
anonymity to the ingroup would stem from a different process from that involved in 
conditions of total visibility to the ingroup. In fact, the process proposed within the 
SIDE model to underlie responses under anonymous conditions, i.e., an increased 
salience of group membership, is precisely dependent on the inability to discern dif­
ferences within the group. It follows that when differences within the group are 
highly visible (i.e. when both participants and their responses are visible to the 
ingroup) pro-group behaviour cannot stem from a similar process. Instead, since what 
characterises a situation of total visibility to the ingroup is the ability to match par­
ticipants to their responses, it seems reasonable to expect that self-presentation 
processes may be involved. That is, low identifiers are likely to increase adoption of 
pro-group behaviour when totally visible to the ingroup with the aim of providing a 
positive image of themselves. As we discussed earlier, if this self-presentation is sim­
ilar to that associated with accountability manipulations, pro-group expressions 
merely serve the instrurnental goal of protecting seIf-image, and consequently we 
may expect no increase in identification in this condition. However, visibility of 
respondents and their responses to the ingroup does not necessarily imply account­
ability, in the sense of a requirement to share and justify responses to the ingroup 
(see e.g., Tetlock, 1996). Therefore, the process of self-presentation involved here 
may, instead of being caused by a need of self-protection, also stem from the oppor­
tunity to forge bonds with other group members by projecting an impression of self 
and forming an impression of others. If so, then self-presentation here may in fact be 
associated with an increase in identification, developed out of the creation of inter­
personal bonds within the group. 

The results of this study showed that participants' choice of strategy for status 
improvement was consistent with our predictions. Whereas the manipulations of vis­
ibility did not affect high identifiers ' behaviour, they did affect low identifiers ' 
choice of strategy for status improvement. Indeed, low identifiers worked more often 
with the group when totally anonymous to the ingroup, and when both responses and 
respondents were visible to the ingroup. In addition, analysis of participants' reported 
concerns with the group showed that while high identifiers were equally concerned 
with the group across experimental conditions, low identifiers were more concerned 
with the group when both responses and respondents were anonymous to the ingroup. 
Analysis of covariance revealed that this increase in concern with the group actually 
mediated low identifiers ' choices to work with the group when totally anonymous. In 
turn, both low and high identifiers reported greater self-to-group similarity when 
totally visible to the ingroup. This increase in judgements of self-to-group similarity 
mediated the effect of the manipulations on low identifiers ' choices to work with the 
group when both responses and respondents were visible to the ingroup. In addition, 
both low and high identifiers reported higher degrees of identification after group 
interaction when participants were totally visible to the ingroup. Moreover, a ten­
dency was revealed for identification among low and high identifiers to be higher 
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also under conditions of total anonymity to the ingroup, although this was not statis­
tically significant. Analysis of covariance, however, revealed that degree of identifi­
cation did not mediate the effect of the manipulations on low identifiers ' responses. 
That is, although context manipulations also affected degree of identification, this did 
not play a role in predicting behaviour, suggesting that the increase in identification 
may have stemmed from the particular form of interaction with the group that was 
evoked in that context, rather than having caused it. 

In sum, low identifiers were motivated to work with the group in two different cir­
cumstances, and due to distinct considerations. Low identifiers ' choices to work with 
the group under conditions of total anonymity to the ingroup seem to have stemmed 
from an increased concern with the group's fate. Although this condition seemed to 
be associated with an increase in identification, this was not significant, and did not 
predict low identifiers ' choices. By contrast, when both responses and respondents 
were visible, low identifiers' choices were mediated by judgements of self-to-group 
similarity. Again, although this situation was significantly associated with an 
increase in ingroup identification, there is no evidence that this was the motivation 
underlying low identifiers ' behaviour. 

Again, these results indicate that different contextual conditions related to 
anonymity manipulations may be associated with pro-group behaviour. However, the 
psychological processes underlying similar forms of behaviour may be quite differ­
ent. One important consequence is that responses on different measures are likely to 
show different patterns, which correspond to the expression of distinct motivations 
for the same behaviour. This fmding highlights the importance of considering various 
forms of identity expression in order to investigate the processes implicated by dis­
tinct contexts. In addition, it must be noted that whether anonymity may be said to 
have increased, decreased, or to have had no effect at all on normative responses 
depends on the comparisons that we choose to make. In this sense, the results of this 
study seem consistent with an analysis of previous research in terms of which 
anonymity manipulations have been investigated. However, to date we know of little 
research that has examined the role of degree of identification with the ingroup in 
moderating effects of anonymity manipulations, and therefore comparisons with pre­
vious studies are to be made with reservations. Further research should therefore 
attempt to replicate and extend these fmdings. 

Conclusions 

An analysis of previous investigations of the effects of anonymity manipulations on 
pro-group behaviour confmned that while high identifiers seem to be consistent in 
their loyalty to the group's goals, low identifiers seem more reluctant to display pro­
group behaviour. However, our analysis also shows that despite this reluctance, low 
identifiers may be motivated by various circumstances to follow the group' s norms 
and focus on the improvement of the group' s status. In specific, low identifiers may 
be led to work with the group 1) when rendered accountable to the ingroup, 2) in 
conditions of total anonymity to the ingroup, and 3) in circumstances where both 
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respondents and their responses are visible to the ingroup. Generally, we may say 
that normative expressions are facilitated when either very litde or very much per­
sonal information is disc10sed (see also Sassenberg, in this volume). Although it has 
certainly been useful to distinguish between low and high identifiers with regard to 
their inc1inations towards the group, the fmdings discussed in this paper suggest that 
this distinction should not be taken to mean that it is impossible to attempt to per­
suade low identifiers to focus on group goals. In fact, these results support the view 
that we cannot limit social influence to a process of identification with a group and 
its goals, and that instead other processes may underlie the endorsement of group 
norms (see also McGarty, this volume). 

In fact, our analysis suggests that group members may be persuaded to focus on 
group goals through different processes. High identifiers seem to work on behalf of 
the group out of an internalised concern with the group and its goals. Consistent with 
self-categorisation theory, identification with a group seems to be accompanied by 
the adoption of group norms and goals as self-relevant, which is refIected in pro­
group behaviour across a wide variety of contexts (Hogg & Turner, 1987; Turner et 
al., 1987). In turn, when identification with the group is weak, group and individual 
interests are likely to stand in contradiction, and therefore additional motivations may 
be necessary for pro-group behaviour to ensue. The evidence discussed in this paper 
suggests that accountability to the ingroup may introduce such additional motiva­
tions : by rendering group members vulnerable to disapproval by others, accountabil­
ity to the ingroup promotes pro-group behaviour among low identifiers as a strategy 
to avoid such disapproval (Barreto & Ellemers, in press). 

Interpersonal processes also seem to lie at the basis of group influence when low 
identifiers are totally visible to the ingroup, even if not explicidy accountable for 
their responses. In fact, among those who initially identify weakly with the group, 
visibility of participants and their responses to the ingroup seems to promote a con­
cern with similarity to other ingroup members, both in general self-defmition and in 
behavioural displays. The increase in identification associated with this condition 
may be taken to indicate that the process here is of a different nature from that 
elicited by accountability manipulations. In fact, although we do not dispute that self­
presentation may constitute an important part of both processes, it would seem that 
its consequences may depend on what precisely motivates self-presentational con­
cerns. In particular, when self-presentation sterns from a need to justify one's actions 
it does not seem to create commitment to the group, whereas conditions akin to face­
to-face interaction may be associated with an increase in group identification. How­
ever, in our studies, this increase in identification was not at the origin of low identi­
fiers' behaviour, and rather it seemed to be a by-product of the manipulations, or 
even a result of within-group interaction. Our suggestion is that tota! visibility to the 
ingroup encourages group members ' interest in each other, thereby facilitating within 
group interaction (see also Postrnes & Spears, this volume). This interaction, in turn, 
may grant the group membership psychological reality, giving place to identification 
with the group. That a situation commonly associated with self-presentation 
processes is here associated with stronger identification is in fact consistent with the 
idea that social identity and self-presentation processes may be c10sely related, and 
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that their separation may at times not only be difficult but also not very informative 
(see e.g., EmIer & Reicher, 1995). 

A different process seems to be at hand when participants are totally anonymous 
to the ingroup. Indeed, total anonymity to the ingroup seems to have motivated low 
identifiers to focus on group improvement out of an increase in concern with the 
group's goals. The lack of any other information besides group membership and sta­
tus seems to have worked so as to increase focus on group membership, rendering it 
as a more relevant basis for regulation of behaviour. Self-to-group similarity did not 
play any role in this condition, further supporting our conclusion that there is a dif­
ference between the underlying processes in the two conditions of visibility. 
Although this condition also seemed to be associated with an increase in identifica­
tion, this was not significant and, again, did not mediate pro-group behaviour. 

It should be noted that an important implication of the view that degree of identifi­
cation depends on the characteristics of the particular context under examination is 
that group members that initially award little importance to a given membership may 
over time come to focus on that same group and its goals if contextually stimulated 
(Turner, 1999). This may serve to drawanimportant distinction between the implica­
tions of variations in degree of identification and in salience of individual vs. group 
identity, as manipulated in previous investigations of the effects of anonymity (see 
e.g., Spears et al., 1990). In fact, when addressed as an individual (i.e., the 'individual 
salience' condition in the study by Spears et al.), the opportunity to develop a higher 
degree of identification is constrained. However, if addressed as a group member (i.e., 
the 'group salience' condition), and required to be involved in group tasks, those that 
initially prefer to disregard their group identity, may come to award it importance in 
a different time and context (see also Barreto & Ellemers, 1999a; Tajfel, 1981; 
Turner et al., 1987). In sum, for group identities to matter in specific contexts people 
have to be able to perceive themselves as included in a given category. 

The analysis made in this paper also seems to resolve some of the inconsistencies 
within previous investigations of the effects of anonymity. In this paper, we have 
argued that the effects of anonymity must be understood by reference to a range of 
aspects. Firstly, the effects of anonymity must not be mentioned in isolation from 
what exactly is being manipulated and compared. The discussion of the effects of 
visibility to the ingroup, for instance, shows that depending on the specific proce­
dures employed, group members may be said to remain unaffected by the manipula­
tions, or rather to be motivated to increase, or decrease normative displays. Secondly, 
degree of identification seems to be a crucial moderator of the effects of anonyrnity 
manipulations. In regard to certain forms of identity expression, high identifiers do 
not show any variation across contexts, while low identifiers may be more clearly 
affected by the manipulation of anonymity to the ingroup. However, this is not to say 
that anonymity does not affect high identifiers, whose statements of similarity of self­
to-group and degree of identification after group interaction did show an effect of 
anonymity to the ingroup. 

In fact, an additional point regarding the effects of anonyrnity to the ingroup worth 
mentioning is that the patterns that are likely to be found depend on the specific mea­
sures employed. Indeed, if different circumstances are associated with distinct 
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processes, we are likely to find that while one aspect of group membership is stressed 
in one context, another is enhanced in a different context (Barreto & Ellemers, 
1999b). In fact, even closely related aspects of one's group membership may each 
have their own specific context of relevance (see also Ellemers, Kortekaas, & Ouw­
erkerk, 1999). In addition, different responses may result from similar motivations, 
whereas distinct motivations may underlie sirnilar behavioural displays (Barreto & 
Ellemers, in press). The irnplication is that a more complete picture of the effects of 
context may be obtained if variations across measures are not taken as a nuisance, but 
rather as informing us about the particular ways in which diverse aspects of one's 
group memberships vary and come to be expressed. In sum, in order to understand 
the effects of anonymity, we need to pay close attention to the particulars of the sit­
uation under study. 

Clearly, besides the ones we have examined, other factors associated with 
anonymity need further investigation, some of which we are aware is currently under 
way (e.g., Douglas & McGarty, this volume; Postrnes & Spears, this volume; 
Sassenberg, this volume). In addition, although we believe that the research dis­
cussed in this paper provides some important clues as to the psychological processes 
involved in motivating group members to engage in pro-group behaviour, future 
research should attempt to further clarify the processes involved. 
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